Reference
Number
2017/01
2017/02
2017/03
2017/04
2017/05
2017/06
2017/07
2017/08
2017/09
2017/10
2017/11
2017/12

Details of Request
Requested information regarding the number of complaints received about officers/staff using
PNC
Requested details about ICT and PAYE
Requested details of the PCC response to CoP consultation on police
Requested information on car thefts and convictions in Pound Lane, Bookham Common
Requested details regarding a specific police car
Requested details regarding illegal hunts
Requested details about the ICT project SIREN
Requested details regarding meetings David has had with political party groups, and if they
had treated him to any gifts/hospitality
Requested information regarding commissioned services for survivors of domestic violence
Requested details regarding photocopiers, MFDs and desktop printers
Requested details regarding contributions towards policing from companies doing oil
exploration in Surrey
Requested information regarding serial domestic violence offenders and serial stalkers

Response
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force
Sent the relevant link to the PCC website:
http://www.surrey-pcc.gov.uk/?s=SIREN
David has not met with other political party groups; he has only
met with the Woking Asian Conservatives
http://www.surrey-pcc.gov.uk/wpcontent/uploads/2017/04/Womens-Aid-FOI.pdf
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force
Information not held by the OPCC - forwarded to the Force

Request for information: -The total amount earmarked from the PCC’s budget (and force’s if
applicable) for 2017/18 to pay for PFI and/or PF2 -projects/schemes/liabilities?
-Which individual schemes these are and how much each cost in 2017/18?
-The total amounts for 2016/17 and 2015/16?

Response sent that neither the Office of the Police and Crime
Commissioner nor Surrey Police have any completed or in
progress Private Finance projects, so no financial provision has
been made for such projects.

1. How much is your Chief Executive paid?
2. When did they start work in the OPCC?
3. What payment was made to the previous Chief Executive when they left?
4. How many OPCC staff have been made redundant, dismissed or taken voluntary exit or
early retirement since April 2016?
5. What is the total amount given to them in voluntary exit payments, redundancy pay,
severance payments, lump sums, payments in lieu of notice, compensation awards and
pension payments?
6. What was the single highest payment?

1. The salary for the Chief Executive is £73,300 (£88,000 fulltime equivalent).
2. The current Chief Executive has been in post since the
inception of PCCs in November 2012
3. Non-applicable
4. None
5. Non applicable
6. Non applicable

Requested to know the number of incidents recorded for workplace bullying lodged against
the PCC and his Office since his time in office to the most recent

There have been no incidents of workplace bullying lodged
against the PCC or his Office

2017/13

2017/14
2017/19

2017/20

2017/21

For each financial year 2009/10, 2010/11, 2011/12, 2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16,
2016/17 (if possible. If not then please provide for calendar year):
1. How much was spent by the PCC on services for: a: Victim's service b)sexual
violence/domestic violence
2. Broken down by year, please provide detauls of the types of sexual violence/domestic
violence programmes that were funded e.g. refuge shelters, counselling, work with male
perpetrators
I would be grateful if you could please provide further clarity around the start and end dates
of the contract you have in place for the provision of 'National Driver Offender Retraining
Scheme' (NDORS) services. Were these services procured directly or under a framework?
1. Which IT Service Management (ITSM) solutions are currently being used by your
organisation in their IT operations and Service Desk functions.
2. How much did the organisation spend on this solution? (Please provide initial setup /
deployment costs and ongoing costs)
3. Which company did your organisation procure the current solution from and by which
method? (i.e. Direct Award / Tender etc.)
4. When does the current ITSM solution contract expire?
5. Who in the organisation is responsible for deciding which ITSM tool is used? (Please
provide name and job title)

http://www.surrey-pcc.gov.uk/wpcontent/uploads/2018/01/2017_20.pdf

Information not held by the OPCC - advised to contact Surrey
Police

Information not helf by the OPCC - forwarded to Surrey Police

2017/22
In their financial statement for the year 2015/16, the charity: Women in Prison stated that
they had received £25,000 in funding from the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner,
Surrey; and by the end of this financial year had not used it. Can you tell me the following: Why did the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner, Surrey give the charity: Women in
Prison funding?
http://www.surrey-pcc.gov.uk/wp- What was the funding to be used for?
content/uploads/2018/01/2017_23.pdf
- What conditions of repayment were applied to the funding if the funds were not used?
- What future plans does the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner, Surrey have for
giving funding to the charity?
- What funding has the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner, Surrey given to male
equivalent projects?
2017/23

Individuals have a right, commonly referred to as a subject access request (SAR), created by
section 7 of the Data Protection Act. I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information
Act 2000 to request the following information regarding your processing of subject access
requests:
1.
How many subject access requests did you receive the identifying paperwork for and process
in 2014?
2. How many subject access requests did you receive the identifying paperwork for and
process in 2015?
3. How many subject access requests did you receive the identifying paperwork for and
Information not held by the OPCC - advised to contact Surrey
process in 2016?
Police
4. How many subject access requests you rejected in 2014?
5. How many subject access requests you rejected in 2015?
6. How many subject access requests you rejected in 2016?
7. What was the average cost for you to process a subject access request in 2014?
8. What was the average cost for you to process a subject access request in 2015?
9. What was the average cost for you to process a subject access request in 2016?
10. How much do you charge an individual to process a subject access request?
2017/24
I would like to submit a freedom of information request in relation to sexual harassment
complaints by staff. Can I ask for the following information for over the last three calendar
years?
How many sexual harassment complaints have been made by staff?
How many sexual harassment complaints have been made against senior officers? What
were the claims?
How many sexual harassment complaints were upheld? What were the sanctions?
How many sexual harassment complaints were dismissed?
What training does the force offer to reduce sexual harassment complaints?

No complaints made by staff within the OPCC. No training
offered to staff within the OPCC.

2017/25
1. Did your PCC, their deputy or any OPCC staff attend the Conservative party conference in
October this year? If not, you may disregard the below questions
2. If so, how many people attended, for how long and did they take annual leave?
3. How much public money was spent on:
a. Accommodation – please name the hotel where they stayed
b. Travel – please state what type of transport and class of travel (ie first class etc)
c. Entertainment and subsistence – please name any restaurants where meals eaten
d. Sundry expenses
4. Was there any correspondence between the PCC and anyone within the OPCC regarding
any aspect of the trip including the cost? If so please provide copies
2017/26

1.       Yes, the PCC attended the conference
2. Just the PCC
3a. Unknown - the PCC arranged himself and paid personally
3b. Train - unknown cost or class of travel as PCC arranged
himself and paid personally
3c. Unknown - PCC arranged his own commmitments whilst at
the conference
3d. Please find attached a link to the PCC’s gifts and hospitality
register which includes the hospitality which he received during
his time at the conference http://www.surrey-pcc.gov.uk/wpcontent/uploads/2012/09/Nov-17-Website.pdf
4. No

2017/27

2017/28

Please advise for 2015, 2016 and 2017 to date a list of reported thefts of lead building
materials (lead roofing material, lead pipes for example) within the borough of Surrey. List
should show town, street address, type of building or site material stolen from (ie church,
residential, occupied, construction site), date of theft, details of material reported stolen. In
each reported case please advise whether any arrests were made and if so, whether there
were any prosecutions and if so what the outcome was in terms of verdict, fines sentencing.
If any part of this request is unclear please contact me at your early convenience.
I am requesting the following information under the freedom of information act:
What is the daily rate you pay your legally qualified chair for misconduct panels?
Are there any other fees you pay your LQC for any work related to misconduct hearings,
preparations and report writing? If so, please give details
What is the daily rate you pay your supporting members of misconduct panels?
Are there any other fees you pay to misconduct panel members for any relevant work? If so,
please give details
Are officers subject to misconduct proceedings able to claim expenses, eg for travel? If so
please give details
Please release full details of all expenses claimed in connection with misconduct hearings,
investigation, preparation and reports, broken down by each hearing for the last twelve
months
How many misconduct hearings have you held in the last twelve months and how long did
they last for?
How may speed cameras are there across Surrey
How many actual are in working operation in Surrey
How may speed cameras are there in Spelthorne
How many actual are in working operation in Spelthorne

Information not held by OPCC - forwarded to Surrey Police

http://www.surrey-pcc.gov.uk/wpcontent/uploads/2018/01/2017_28.pdf

Information not held by OPCC - forwarded to Surrey Police

2017/29
Surrey Police have participated in a young drivers safety event this week at Dorking Halls.
This morning, Surrey Police displayed a 2017 Red Ford Mustang in Surrey Police markings
(Reg AF17 UPX).
Information not held by OPCC - forwarded to Surrey Police
Could you please provide the business case that justified the use of Public Money for the
purchase of such a vehicle and the record of the decision making process that authorised its
display it at a young drivers safety event?
2017/30

2017/31

1. Does your Constabulary/Force currently use a private company to undertake any of the
following services:
• Public Relations
• Social Media Communications
• External Stakeholder Communications
• Internal Stakeholder Communications
2. If yes, can you please confirm:
• When the current contract was last let
• When the current contract expires
• Whether the current contract has options to extend its length
• When you expect to retender the contract.
3. If no (to question 1 above), are you considering letting such a contract in the future and if
so, do you have an approximate timetable for engaging the market?
Part 2
4. Have you used a private company to help you with any other marketing or public
information campaigns in the past 2 years?
5. If so, could you please provide a brief overview of what those campaigns were about and
approximately how

Information not held by OPCC - forwarded to Surrey Police

Please send me: Relevant documents showing information, correspondence and decisions
made regarding the investigation into the complaint involving Chief Constable Nick Ephgrave
in relation to issuing a search warrant. This includes what the complaint is, what it involves,
what date it was made, who it involves and any subsequent action taken.
http://www.surrey-pcc.gov.uk/wpPlease also send me relevant documents showing information, correspondence and
content/uploads/2018/01/2017_32.pdf
decisions made regarding the ongoing active legal proceeding into the above complaint
including what the active legal proceeding is, what it involves, who it involves and relevant
dates.
2017/32
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information.
1. The name of the company currently supplying energy to your premises, for electricity and
gas.
2. The name of the tariff that the electricity and gas are supplied by.
3. Your annual energy bill cost for the past financial year.
2017/33

Information not held by OPCC - advised to contact Surrey
Police

